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CS-2024 Bid Tabulation
Smallwares
Item:  975-901-15010 UOM: Box Hairnet, Nylon, 22", Black Est Qty: 25
Lightweight, 100% Latex Free
Safety Zone or approved equal
144 Per Box
11110 11400 Inc. $5.49 Choice 999BK24NLHN 999BK24NLHN 24" - 100/Pack $137.25 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $13.71 Amercare Royal RPH144LTBK 722745 $342.87
Item:  975-901-15015 UOM: Box Hairnet, Nylon, 22", Light Brown Est Qty: 25
Lightweight, 100% Latex Free
Safety Zone or approved equal
144 Per Box
11110 11400 Inc. $5.49 Choice 999WH24NLHN 999WH24NLHN 24" - 100/Pack $137.25 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $13.71 Amercare Royal RPH144LTDB 709646 $342.87
Item: 975-901-15020 UOM: Box Hairnet, Nylon, 22", Dark Brown Est Qty: 61
Lightweight, 100% Latex Free
Safety Zone or approved equal
144 Per Box
11110 11400 Inc. $5.49 Choice 999BR24NLHN 999BR24NLHN 24" - 100/Pack $334.89 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $13.71 Amercare Royal RPH144LTBK 709646 $836.59
Item:  975-901-21010 UOM: Each  Bib Apron, Cloth, 31" x 26", White Est Qty: 38
Cotton/Poly Blend, Pockets, Wrinkle Resistant, Machine Washable
Winco or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $2.69 Choice 160BIB2PKTBK 160BIB2PKTBK Black - 34" x 30" $102.22 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.43 John Ritzenthaler CLBIAWHT 859400 $206.39
Item:  975-901-25010 UOM: Each  Oven Mitts, Elbow Length (17 Inches) Est Qty: 12
Protects up to 425 Degrees, Fire Retardant
San Jamar 800FG17 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $7.99 Choice 187FLAME17HD 187FLAME17HD $95.88 []

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $10.14 John Ritzenthaler CL2PX23BETFT 859385 $121.65
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Item: 975-901-25020 UOM: Each Pot Holders, Terry Cloth, 8" x 8" Est Qty: 176

Industrial Grade Terry Cloth, Protects to 450 Degrees Fahrenheit with Intermittent Use

San Jamar 802TPH or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.28 John Ritzenthaler CLTPHSBET 859412 $928.40
11110 11400 Inc. $17.99 Choice 160TPH8WH 160TPH8WH 12/Pack $3,166.24 []
Item:  975-901-25025 UOM: Each  Pan Grabber / Baker's Pad, 8.5 x 11 Inches Est Qty: 158

With Wrist Strap, Extra Thick Layer of Terry Cloth Outside and a "Bestex" Interior, Contains an Inner Steam Barrier

for Extra Protection against Steam and Hot Liquids, Protects to 375 Degrees Fahrenheit with Intermittent Use,

Machine Washable

San Jamar 803PG or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.49 WebstaurantStore 160TPHXWEB 160TPHXWEB with Wrist Strap $235.42 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.74 CFS Brands 803PG-TRI 859372 $907.39
Item:  975-901-25030 UOM: Case Bar Mop Towels, Terry/Cotton, 17 x 20 Inches, White Est Qty: 123

Ribbed, Machine Washable

San Jamar 700BRT28 or approved equal

12 Per Case
11110 11400 Inc. $4.69 Choice 167700BRT24 167700BRT24 16" x 19" $576.87 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $14.53 John Ritzenthaler CLBMRT 859401 $1,787.30
Item: 975-901-25040 UOM: Case Bar Mop Towels, Microfiber, Blue Est Qty: 75

Machine Washable

Janico 6005BL or approved equal

24 Per Case
11110 11400 Inc. $3.99 Lavex 274MFCL12BL 274MFCL12BL 12" x 12" - 12/Pack $299.25 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $6.17 Winco BTM-16B BTM-16B $463.03
Item:  975-901-28010 UOM: Each Bag-Sealing Dispenser, 3/8" Capacity Est Qty: 25

Metal-Framed, Can Be Table Mounted

Shurtape SD937 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp No Bid []
88888 NO AWARD $0.00 $0.00
11110 11400 Inc. $15.99 Lavex 562BAGSEALER 562BAGSEALER $399.75 []
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Item: 975-901-28020 UOM: Case Bag Tape, 3/8" x 540', 3" Core, Red Est Qty: 25

For Use with Bag-Sealing Dispenser

Shurtape PP808 or approved equal

16 Per Case
76755 TriMark SS Kemp No Bid []
88888 NO AWARD $0.00 $0.00
11110 11400 Inc. $3.29 Lavex 562BAGTRED3818 562BAGTRED381 3/8" x 180 Yards $82.25 []

80

Item: 975-901-28022 UOM: Case Bag Tape, 3/8" x 540", 3" Core, Green Est Qty: 25

For Use with Bag-Sealing Dispenser

Shurtape PP808 or approved equal

16 Per Case
76755 TriMark SS Kemp No Bid []
88888 NO AWARD $0.00 $0.00
11110 11400 Inc. $3.29 Lavex 562BAGTGRN3818 562BAGTGRN381 3/8" x 180 Yards $82.25 []

80

Item:  975-901-35002 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Cooking, Pocket Probe, Digital Est Qty: 4

Rotating Display, Foldaway Probe, 2-5 Second Readings, High Accuracy, Backlight, Displays in C or F, Automatic

On/Off, NSF Certified, Food -Safe ABS Plastic, Measurement Range: -40 to 572F / -40 to 300C, Requires Two AAA

Batteries

CDN DTF572-BK or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $44.61 CDN 221DTF572 221DTF572 $178.44 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $46.47 CDN DTF572-BK DTF572-BK $185.88
Item:  975-901-35005 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Cooking, Pocket Probe, Digital Est Qty: 44

Temp Range: -40F to +450F, 3 1/8" Probe, Water Resistant, Hold Function, Built-in Clip and Protection Sheath, NSF

Certified

Winco TMT-DG4 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $8.19 Choice 914DPT450 914DPT450 3" $360.36 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $43.35 Taylor Precision 5256860 5256860 $1,907.44
Item:  975-901-35012 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Cooking, Pocket Probe, Dial Est Qty: 13

NSF Certified / Food-Safe ABS Plastic Sheath with BioCote, Water & Shatterproof, 1" Magnified Dial / 5" Stem,

Polycarbonate Lens, Stainless Steel Housing, Field Calibration with Tool on Sheath, Mounting: Pocket Clip, 0-220F

CDN IRT220 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $3.33 CDN IRT220 914T220 $43.29 []
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76755 TriMark SS Kemp $20.85 Taylor Precision 9877FDA78TM 1128979 $271.01
Item:  975-901-35015 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Refrigerator / Freezer Est Qty: 36

Dial Thermometer with Fahrenheit and Celsius, 2.25" Dial, Stainless Steel, Hangs or Stands, -20 / +80 Degrees

Fahrenheit, Safe Temperature Zone Indicators, Red Pointer, NSF Certified

Taylor 3507 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.79 Choice 9142DRFT 9142DRFT 2" $64.44 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $3.09 Lifetime 3507FS 771450 $111.07
Item:  975-901-35020 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Oven, Dial Est Qty: 16

2.45" Dial, Stainless Steel, With Clip (for Oven Rack), 150 - 600 Degrees Fahrenheit, With Food Temperature

Guidelines, NSF Certified

Taylor 603 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.99 Choice 9142DOT 9142DOT 2" $31.84 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.74 Taylor Precision 3506FS 1128979 $43.88
Item:  975-901-35025 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Pocket Test, 1" Dial Est Qty: 6

Stainless Steel, 40 - 180 Degrees Fahrenheit, Protective Sheath, NSF Certified

Winco TMT-P2 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $2.19 Choice 9147220 9147220 5", 0 - 220 Degrees Fahrenheit $13.14 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.41 ABC Pro 859287 859287 $14.48
Item:  975-901-35030 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Dishwasher, Waterproof, Digital Est Qty: 3

32 to 194F (0 to 90C), NSF Listed, 5"x5"

*Ensures proper cleaning by providing proof meeting the temperature regulation of achieving 180°F (82°C) during

dishwashing

Taylor 8791 or ThermoWorks TX-5100 ONLY
11110 11400 Inc. $36.99 Taylor 8791 9138791 $110.97 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $51.09 Lifetime 859287 1128981 $153.28
Item:  975-901-35040 UOM: Each Thermometer, Combo Pack Est Qty: 2

Thermocouple Instrument with Lanyard, Wall Bracket, DuraNeedle Probe; NSF Certified; -40 to 500 Degrees F;

Shock Resistant; Requires 3 AAA Batteries

Cooper Atkins 93230-K or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $169.99 CDN 93230-K 27393230K $339.98 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $176.28 Cooper-Atkins 93230-K 93230-K $352.56
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Item:  975-901-35045 UOM: Each  Thermometer, Combo Pack, Direct Connect Est Qty: 2

Thermocouple Instrument with Lanyard, Direct Connect DuraNeedle Probe; NSF Certified; -40 to 500 Degrees F;

Water Resistant; Requires 3 AAA Batteries

Cooper Atkins 94020-K or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $181.37 Cooper-Atkins 94020-K 94020-K $362.75
11110 11400 Inc. $188.99 CDN 94020-K 27394020K $377.98 []
Item:  975-901-35100 UOM: Each Digital Pocket Timer Est Qty: 2

Minute/Second Timing, Counts Up or Down, 0.7" Read-Out, Clip, Magnet, and Stand Positioning, AAA Battery (1)

Operated

Taylor 5806 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $4.59 AvaTime 914SDT100M 914SDT100M 100 Minutes $9.18 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $6.40 Taylor Precision 5806 1128989 $12.79
Item:  975-901-36100 UOM: Each Scale, Digital Est Qty: 2

Easy-to-Read LCD Readout, Measures Ounces, Auto Off, NSF Listed, Runs on AC Adapter (included) or 2 AAA

Batteries

Taylor TE220S or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $25.50 Taylor Precision TE11FTP 1128587 $51.00
11110 11400 Inc. $86.49 Taylor TE220S 608TE220S $172.98 []
Item:  975-901-45010 UOM: Tub Probe Cleaning Wipes, Bactericidal Est Qty: 75

Comark PW70T or approved equal

700 Per Tub
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.25 Taylor Precision 9999N 9999N $393.56
11110 11400 Inc. $38.49 WipesPlus 50035084 50035084 10/Case $2,886.75 []
Item:  975-901-45020 UOM: Case Sanitizer Test Strips, Chlorinated Est Qty: 2

Convenient Dispenser Stops Wet Fingers from Damaging Unused Strips, Tests from 10 PPM to 200 PPM, Produces

Color Change in 30 Seconds or Less

Bar Maid DIS-302 or approved equal

12/ 100 Per Case
11110 11400 Inc. $4.79 Noble 373CHLORTEST 373CHLORTEST $9.58 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $66.98 Taylor Precision DIS-302 $133.95
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Item:  975-901-50010 UOM: Set Measuring Cups, Stainless Steel Est Qty: 2
Set: 1/4, 1/3, 1/2, 1 Cup; Long Handles; Graduated; Dishwasher Safe
Browne Halco 1190MC or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $3.66 Winco 859136 859136 $7.32
11110 11400 Inc. $5.99 Choice 4074PCHDMC 4074PCHDMC Heavy Weight $11.98 []
Item:  975-901-50020 UOM: Set Measuring Spoons, Stainless Steel Est Qty: 2

Set: 1/4 tsp, 1/2 tsp, 1 tsp & 1 tbsp; Metallic Ring; Dishwasher Safe
Browne Halco 2316 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $0.74 ABC Pro 859137 859137 $1.49
11110 11400 Inc. $1.59 Choice 4074PCDHWMS 4074PCDHWMS $3.18 D
Item: 975-901-51010 UOM: Case Forks, Stainless, Medium Weight, 18/0, 7.25 Inches Est Qty: 8

Magnetic Quality, Works with Flatware Retrievers
Walco or approved equal

36 Per Case
11110 11400 Inc. $1.39 Choice 267010005 267010005 7" - 12/Case $11.12 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $6.83 ABC Pro 657 030 1188539 $54.66
Item:  975-901-51020 UOM: Case Teaspoons, Stainless, Medium Weight, 18/0, 5.94 Inches Est Qty: 2

Magnetic Quality, Works with Flatware Retrievers
Walco or approved equal

36 Per Case
11110 11400 Inc. $1.09 Choice 267010001 267010001 57/8" - 12/Case $2.18 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.01 Libbey 657 001 1190456 $10.03
Item:  975-901-55010 UOM: Each  Spatula (Scraper), Bowl Shaped, 9.5 Inches Est Qty: 6

White, Commercial Dishwasher Safe, Seamless Construction
Rubbermaid 1933 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $0.89 Choice 40710RSPNULA 40710RSPNULA 10" $5.34 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.23 Libbey 859217 859217 $7.41
Item:  975-901-55012 UOM: Each  Spatula (Scraper), Bowl Shaped, 13.5 Inches Est Qty: 16

White, Commercial Dishwasher Safe, Seamless Construction
Rubbermaid 1934 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $1.49 Choice 40714RSPNULA 40714RSPNULA 14" $23.84 []

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.23 ABC Pro 859218 859218 $35.70
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Item:  975-901-55015 UOM: Each  Spatula (Scraper), Flat Blade, 9.5 Inches Est Qty: 2
White, Commercial Dishwasher Safe, Seamless Construction
Rubbermaid 1901 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $0.79 Choice 40710RSPTULA 40710RSPTULA 10" $1.58 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $0.97 ABC Pro 859222 859222 $1.94
Item:  975-901-55017 UOM: Each  Spatula (Scraper), Flat Blade, 13.5 Inches Est Qty: 36

White, Commercial Dishwasher Safe, Seamless Construction
Rubbermaid 1905 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $0.99 Choice 40714RSPTULA 40714RSPTULA 14" $35.64 D
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.57 ABC Pro 859220 859220 $56.57
Item: 975-901-57010 UOM: Each Pastry / Basting Brush, Silicone, 3 Inches Est Qty: 2

Stain- & Odor-Resistant, 7 Inch Handle
Carlisle Sparta 4040505 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp No Bid []
88888 NO AWARD $0.00 $0.00
11110 11400 Inc. $4.49 Carlisle 4040505 27140405 $8.98 []
Item:  975-901-65000 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Perforated, 2z Est Qty: 16
Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Red) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans, Heat
Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit
ABC Pro PPG-2-P or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.19 Choice 40720ZPSPRD 40720ZPSPRD $19.04 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.45 ABC Pro 859174 859174 $23.12
Item: 975-901-65005 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Solid, 2z Est Qty: 9
Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Red) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans, Heat
Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit
ABC Pro PPG-2-S or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.19 Choice 40720ZPSSRD 40720ZPSSRD $10.71 []

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.45 ABC Pro 859175 859175 $13.01
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Item: 975-901-65010 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Perforated, 3z Est Qty: 14

Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Beige) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans, Heat

Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit

ABC Pro PPG-3-P or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.29 Choice 40730ZPSPIVY 40730ZPSPIVY  Ivory $18.06 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.54 ABC Pro 859176 859176 $21.61
Item:  975-901-65015 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Solid, 3z Est Qty: 17

Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Beige) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans, Heat

Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit

ABC Pro PPG-3-S or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.29 Choice 40730ZPSSIVY 40730ZPSSIVY  Ivory $21.93 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.54 ABC Pro 859177 859177 $26.24
Item:  975-901-65020 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Perforated, 4z Est Qty: 4

Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Green) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans,

Heat Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit

ABC Pro PPG-4-P or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.49 Choice 40740ZPSPWGN  40740ZPSPWGN $5.96 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.78 ABC Pro 859178 859178 $7.13
Item: 975-901-65025 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Solid, 4z Est Qty: 9

Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Green) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans,

Heat Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit

ABC Pro PPG-4-S or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.49 Choice 40740ZPSSGN 40740ZPSSGN $13.41 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.78 ABC Pro 859179 859179 $16.04
Item: 975-901-65030 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Perforated, 6z Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Black) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans, Heat

Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit

ABC Pro PPG-6-P or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.79 Choice 40760ZPSPBK 40760ZPSPBK $3.58 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.22 ABC Pro 859180 859180 $4.43



Unified Purchasing Cooperative Page 9 of 17
CS-2024 Bid Tabulation

Item: 975-901-65035 UOM: Each  Spoodle, Round, Solid, 6z Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel, Color-Coded (Black) Polypropylene Handle, Notched Handle to Prevent from Sliding into Pans, Heat

Resistant to 200 Degrees Fahrenheit

ABC Pro PPG-6-S or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.79 Choice 40760ZPSSBK 40760ZPSSBK $3.58 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.22 ABC Pro 859181 859181 $4.43
Item:  975-901-65112 UOM: Each  Scoop (Disher), #6 (4 2/3z) Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel Construction, Color-Coded Polypropylene Handle (White), Ribbed Handle, Thumb Disher, Size

Stamped on Bowl Knife Blade, Dishwasher Safe, NSF Certified

Winco ICOP-6 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.22 ABC Pro 859181 859081 $4.43
11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Choice 407TPD6WH 407TPD6WH 5.33 oz. $9.98 []
Item:  975-901-65115 UOM: Each  Scoop (Disher), #8 (4z) Est Qty: 26

Stainless Steel Construction, Color-Coded Polypropylene Handle (Gray), Ribbed Handle, Thumb Disher, Size

Stamped on Bowl Knife Blade, Dishwasher Safe, NSF Certified

Winco ICOP-8 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Choice 407TPD8GY 407TPD8GY $129.74 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.58 ABC Pro 859081 859082 $145.19
Item:  975-901-65120 UOM: Each  Scoop (Disher), #10 (3 3/4z) Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel Construction, Color-Coded Polypropylene Handle (lvory), Ribbed Handle, Thumb Disher, Size

Stamped on Bowl Knife Blade, Dishwasher Safe, NSF Certified

Winco ICOP-10 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Choice 407TPD10IV 407TPD10IV 3.25 oz. $9.98 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.58 ABC Pro 859082 859074 $11.17
Item:  975-901-65125 UOM: Each  Scoop (Disher), #12 (3 1/4z) Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel Construction, Color-Coded Polypropylene Handle (Green), Ribbed Handle, Thumb Disher, Size

Stamped on Bowl Knife Blade, Dishwasher Safe, NSF Certified

Winco ICOP-12 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Choice 407TPD12GN 407TPD12GN 2.66 oz. $9.98 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.58 ABC Pro 859074 859075 $11.17
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Item:  975-901-65130 UOM: Each  Scoop (Disher), #16 (2 3/4z) Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel Construction, Color-Coded Polypropylene Handle (Blue), Ribbed Handle, Thumb Disher, Size
Stamped on Bowl Knife Blade, Dishwasher Safe, NSF Certified

Winco ICOP-16 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Choice 407TPD16BL 407TPD16BL 2 0z. $9.98 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.58 ABC Pro 859075 859076 $11.17
Item:  975-901-65210 UOM: Each Ladle, 2z Est Qty: 5

Stainless Steel, One-Piece Construction, Hooked Handle, Capacity Marked on Handle
Vollrath 46812, Amer Metal L1102 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $0.99 Choice 4070PL2 4070PL2 $4.95 D
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.58 ABC Pro 859076 859118 $27.92
Item: 975-901-65215 UOM: Each Ladle, 4z Est Qty: 4

Stainless Steel, One-Piece Construction, Hooked Handle, Capacity Marked on Handle
Vollrath 46814, Amer Metal L1104 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.22 ABC Pro 859118 859122 $4.89
11110 11400 Inc. $1.49 Choice 4070PL4 4070PL4 $5.96 []
Item:  975-901-65220 UOM: Each Ladle, 6z Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel, One-Piece Construction, Hooked Handle, Capacity Marked on Handle
Vollrath 46816, Amer Metal L1108 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.79 Choice 4070PL6 4070PL6 $3.58 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.01 ABC Pro 859122 859124 $4.02
Item: 975-901-65305 UOM: Each Tongs, Salad, Durable Plastic, 6 Inches Est Qty: 2
Dishwasher Safe, NSF Listed
Carlisle 460602 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $1.29 Carlisle 460606 271N4606BG $2.58 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.52 ABC Pro 859124 723568 $5.03
Item:  975-901-65310 UOM: Each Tongs, 12 Inches Est Qty: 2
Spring Tongs, Stainless Steel, Scalloped Gripping Edges
Vollrath 47113, Amer Metal UTR12 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $0.99 Choice 407LDUT12 407LDUT12 $1.98 []

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.14 CFS Brands 460603 740782 $4.29
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Item:  975-901-65315 UOM: Each  Tongs, 6 Inches, Silicone Tips Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel, Scalloped Gripping Edges
Vollrath Carlisle, Hubert or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $1.39 Choice 407SCUT7 407SCUT7 ™ $2.78 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.46 ABC Pro UTR-12 588774 $2.92
Item:  975-901-65320 UOM: Each Tongs, 12 Inches, Silicone Tips Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel, Scalloped Gripping Edges
Vollrath Carlisle, Hubert or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $2.99 Choice 407SCUT12 407SCUT12 $5.98 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $17.80 Volirath 4780922 601150 $35.60
Item:  975-901-65410 UOM: Each  Sandwich Spreader, 3.5 Inch Blade Est Qty: 4

White Polypropylene Handle (Slip-Resistant Grip), Stainless Steel Blade, NSF Certified
Dexter S173PCP or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $1.69 Choice 220SSPRDW35W  220SSPRDW35W $6.76 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $17.80 Volirath 4781222 859225 $71.19
Item:  975-901-65510 UOM: Each Kbnife, Paring, 3.25 Inch Blade Est Qty: 43

Stainless Steel, Polypropylene Handle, Textured Handle, NSF Certified
Dexter S104SC-PCP or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $1.63 ABC Pro 859225 1005756 $69.99
11110 11400 Inc. $1.99 Choice 220KWPAR325 220KWPAR325 $85.57 D
Item: 975-901-65520 UOM: Each Knife, Chef's, 6 Inch Blade Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel, Poly Handle
Polar K75007 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.21 Dexter-Russell TMO03 1005754 $4.41
11110 11400 Inc. $4.49 Choice 220KWCHEF6 220KWCHEF6 $8.98 []
Item: 975-901-65525 UOM: Each Knife, Chef's, 8 Inch Blade Est Qty: 3
Stainless Steel Blade; Textured, Slip-Resistant, Easy to Clean Sani-Safe Handle; Impervious Blade-to-Handle Seal;
NSF Certified

Dexter S145-8PCP or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Choice 220KWCHEF8 220KWCHEF8 $14.97 ]

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $8.03 Dexter-Russell TM8 1005755 $24.09
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Item: 975-901-73100 UOM: Each  Food Pan, Cold Master, Black, 6" Deep, 6 Quart, Half Size Est Qty: 2
Has Non-Toxic Refrigerant Gel
Carlisle CM110103 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $8.27 Dexter-Russell T™M10 CM110103 $16.55
11110 11400 Inc. $68.99 Carlisle CM110103 271CM1101BK $137.98 []
Item: 975-901-73150 UOM: Each Food Pan, Cold Master, Black, 6" Deep, 15 Quart, Full Size Est Qty: 2

Has Non-Toxic Refrigerant Gel
Carlisle CM110003 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $63.73 CFS Brands CM110103 CM110003 $127.47
11110 11400 Inc. $86.99 Carlisle CM110003 271CM1100BK $173.98 D
Item:  975-901-74950 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, 1/6 Size, 2.5 Inches Deep Est Qty: 4

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30622 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $7.19 Vigor 24716222 24716222 $28.76 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $80.88 CFS Brands CM110003 859263 $323.52
Item: 975-901-74955 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, 1/6 Size, 4 Inches Deep Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30642 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $3.23 ABC Pro 859263 859264 $6.45
11110 11400 Inc. $8.79 Vigor 24716422 24716422 $17.58 []
Item:  975-901-74960 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, 1/6 Size, 6 Inches Deep Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30662 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $4.74 ABC Pro 859264 859265 $9.49
11110 11400 Inc. $11.99 Vigor 24716622 24716622 $23.98 []
Item:  975-901-74980 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, 1/4 Size, 2.5 Inches Deep Est Qty: 4

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30422 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $6.86 ABC Pro 859265 859260 $27.45

<]

11110 11400 Inc. $9.39 Vigor 24714222 24714222 $37.56 []
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Item:  975-901-74990 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, 1/3 Size, 2.5 Inches Deep Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30322 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $4.24 ABC Pro 859260 859257 $8.47
11110 11400 Inc. $9.89 Vigor 24713222 24713222 $19.78 []
Item:  975-901-75005 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Half Size Long, 2.5 Inches Deep Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30522 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.46 ABC Pro 859257 22242 $10.92
11110 11400 Inc. $16.99 Vigor 247121222 247121222 $33.98 []
Item: 975-901-75010 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Half Size, 2.5 Inches Deep Est Qty: 3

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30222 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $10.49 Vigor 24712222 24712222 $31.47 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $19.20 Browne USA 22242 859252 $57.59
Item: 975-901-75015 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Half Size, 4 Inches Deep Est Qty: 6

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30242 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $7.20 ABC Pro 859252 859254 $43.19
11110 11400 Inc. $13.99 Vigor 24712422 24712422 $83.94 []
Item: 975-901-75020 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Half Size, 6 Inches Deep Est Qty: 4

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30262 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $8.92 ABC Pro 859254 859256 $35.70
11110 11400 Inc. $24.49 Vigor 247THALFDR6KT 247HALFDR6KT $97.96 []
Item: 975-901-75025 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Full Size, 2.5 Inches Deep Est Qty: 2

Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30022 or approved equal

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $11.69 ABC Pro 859256 859268 $23.38

<]

11110 11400 Inc. $16.99 Vigor 24711222 24711222 $33.98 []
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Item:  975-901-75030 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Full Size, 4 Inches Deep Est Qty: 12
Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30042 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $11.52 ABC Pro 859268 859270 $138.23
11110 11400 Inc. $23.49 Vigor 24711422 24711422 $281.88 []
Item: 975-901-75035 UOM: Each  Steam Table Pan, Full Size, 6 Inches Deep Est Qty: 4
Stainless Steel (22 Gauge), Anti-Jamming, NSF Certified
Vollrath 30062 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $13.68 ABC Pro 859270 859272 $54.72
11110 11400 Inc. $33.49 Vigor 24711622 24711622 $133.96 []
Item:  975-901-75050 UOM: Each Lid for 1/6 Pan, Solid Est Qty: 8
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75160 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $6.89 Vigor 24716SLD 24716SLD $55.12 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $18.17 ABC Pro 859272 859236 $145.36
Item:  975-901-75052 UOM: Each Lid for 1/6 Pan, Slotted Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75260 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.76 ABC Pro 859236 859235 $5.53
11110 11400 Inc. $6.89 Vigor 24716SLT 24716SLT $13.78 []
Item:  975-901-75055 UOM: Each Lid for 1/4 Pan, Solid Est Qty: 4
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75140 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $2.76 ABC Pro 859235 859234 $11.06
11110 11400 Inc. $8.49 Vigor 24714SLD 24714SLD $33.96 []
Item: 975-901-75057 UOM: Each Lid for 1/4 Pan, Slotted Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75240 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $3.98 ABC Pro 859234 859233 $7.97
11110 11400 Inc. $8.49 Vigor 24714SLT 24714SLT $16.98 []
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Item:  975-901-75060 UOM: Each Lid for 1/3 Pan, Solid Est Qty: 6
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75130 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $4.34 ABC Pro 859233 859232 $26.01
11110 11400 Inc. $9.89 Vigor 24713SLD 24713SLD $59.34 []
Item:  975-901-75062 UOM: Each Lid for 1/3 Pan, Slotted Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75230 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $4.34 ABC Pro 859232 859449 $8.67
11110 11400 Inc. $9.89 Vigor 24713SLT 24713SLT $19.78 []
Item:  975-901-75065 UOM: Each Lid for Half Pan, Solid Est Qty: 14
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75120 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.75 ABC Pro 859449 859231 $80.54
11110 11400 Inc. $10.99 Vigor 24712SLD 24712SLD $153.86 []
Item: 975-901-75067 UOM: Each Lid for Half Pan, Slotted Est Qty: 3
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75220 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $5.75 ABC Pro 859231 77250 $17.26
11110 11400 Inc. $10.99 Vigor 24712SLT 24712SLT $32.97 []
Item:  975-901-75070 UOM: Each Lid for Full Pan, Solid Est Qty: 13
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 77250 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $21.49 Vigor 24711SLD 24711SLD $279.37 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $42.69 Vollrath 77250 859238 $554.93
Item:  975-901-75072 UOM: Each Lid for Full Pan, Slotted Est Qty: 2
Stainless Steel, NSF Certified
Vollrath 75210 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $11.18 ABC Pro 859238 859237 $22.37
11110 11400 Inc. $21.49 Vigor 24711SLT 24711SLT $42.98 []
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Item: 975-901-75110 UOM: Each  Sheet Pan, Half Size, 13 x 18" Est Qty: 35

18 Gauge Aluminum

Vollrath 5303 or approved equal
11110 11400 Inc. $4.99 Baker's Lane 176BUNHALF18 176BUNHALF18 $174.65 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $11.18 ABC Pro 181318 859365 $391.40
Item: 975-901-75112 UOM: Each Sheet Pan, Half Size, 13 x 18", Perforated Est Qty: 2

18 Gauge Aluminum

Vollrath 5303P or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $8.16 Vollrath ALXP-1318P ALXP-1318P $16.32
11110 11400 Inc. $9.49 Baker's Lane 176HALFDPERF 176HALFDPERF 16 Gauge $18.98 ]
Item:  975-901-75115 UOM: Each  Sheet Pan, Full Size, 18 x 26" Est Qty: 42

18 Gauge Aluminum

Vollrath 9002 or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $6.33 Winco 182618 859367 $265.73
11110 11400 Inc. $6.99 Baker's Lane 176BUNFULL18 176BUNFULL18 $293.58 []
Item: 975-901-75117 UOM: Each Sheet Pan, Full Size, 18 x 26", Perforated Est Qty: 52

18 Gauge Aluminum

Vollrath 9002P or approved equal
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $11.77 Vollrath ALXP-1826P ALXP-1826P $611.88
11110 11400 Inc. $12.49 Baker's Lane 176FULLDPERF 176FULLDPERF 16 Gauge $649.48 []
Item: 975-901-78010 UOM: Each Produce Basket, Tapered, Plastic, Black, Small Est Qty: 2

7.5"L x 16"D x 1.5 to 5"H, Wicker Look, Washable

Expressly Hubert 40464 or approved equal
00000 NO BIDS RECEIVED $0.00 $0.00
Iltem: 975-901-78020 UOM: Each  Produce Basket, Tapered, Plastic, Black, Large Est Qty: 2

11.5"L x 16"D x 1.5 to 5"H, Wicker Look, Washable

Expressly Hubert 39534 or approved equal
00000 NO BIDS RECEIVED $0.00 $0.00
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Item:  975-901-78050 UOM: Each Beverage Dispenser, Clear, Polycarbonate, 3 Gallon Est Qty: 2

Quart & Liter Capacity Indicators on Both Sides, Hingeless Lid, Removeable Drip Tray, Handle Can Be Locked in
Open Position for Dispensing Large Amounts of Liquid

Carlisle 1085003 or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $17.99 Choice 176BD3BK2 176BD3BK2 Black, Slim $35.98 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $95.00 CFS Brands 1085003 1085003 $190.00
Item:  975-901-79010 UOM: Pair Gloves, Thermal, Safety, Nitrile, Large Est Qty: 3

Snug Wrist Cuff, Meets ANSI Level A3 Cut Protection, For Use in Freezers
Wells Lamont Y9239TL-PB or approved equal

11110 11400 Inc. $5.29 Cordova 394VP3988L 394VP3988L Latex with Latex Palm Coating $15.87 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $15.04 Allpoints 1331839 1210120 $45.11
Item:  975-901-90022 UOM: Case Cleaner, Chemical Tab, for Combi Oven Est Qty: 22

For Rational Self-Cooking Center
Rational 56.00.210 or approved equal
100 Per Case

11110 11400 Inc. $109.99 Rational 56.00.210 6455600210 $2,419.78 []
76755 TriMark SS Kemp $116.76 Rational 56.00.210A 56.00.210A $2,568.72
Item:  975-901-90023 UOM: Case Care (Scale Dissolving), Chemical Tab, for Combi Oven Est Qty: 15

For Rational Self-Cooking Center
Rational 56.00.562 or approved equal
150 Per Case

11110 11400 Inc. $126.99 Rational 56.00.562 6455600562 $1,904.85 []

76755 TriMark SS Kemp $141.96 Rational 56.00.562 56.00.562 $2,129.40



